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Metabolic syndrome is a known association of obesity 
and carries risk of diabetes and cardiovascular 

disease. Hence, we evaluated the metabolic effects of 
bariatric surgery on morbidly obese patients. We recruited 
40 morbidly obese patients; 26 underwent Laparoscopic 
sleeve gastrectomy and 14 underwent Roux-en-Y gastric 
bypass of which seven and nine were diabetic respectively. 
All patients were evaluated for weight, BMI, FBS, PPBS, 
HbA1c, C-Peptide, Lipid parameters, Mean Arterial 
Pressure at baseline and at two-weeks and at six-months 
post-surgery. We achieved significant reduction in weight 
(p<0.0001; paired Friedman test) at and six months (94.3kg) 
postoperative as compared to baseline (129.7 kg). A mean 
weight loss of 52% for %Excess weight loss and %Excess 
BMI loss. Fasting Blood Glucose was significantly reduced at 
two weeks (132.2mg/dl; p=0.04) and six months (96.7mg/
dl; p=0.01) postoperatively. A total of 56.3% diabetic 
patients achieved an HbA1c levels <5.5 at six months post-
surgery. Fifteen (94%) diabetic patients achieved an HbA1c 
≤6.5 at 6 months post-surgery. C-Peptide levels showed 
significant difference as compared to baseline (6.3) to those 
at 6 months (3.8; p=0.03) and also there was a significant 

difference in reduction of use of antidiabetic medications 
at six months post-surgery (0.3; p<0.0001) when compared 
to baseline (1.4). Difference in improvement in deranged 
lipid parameters (p<0.0001) and Mean Arterial Pressure 
(p<0.0001) became quite significant at six months post-
surgery. These results are in coherence with other studies.
[1,2] Bariatric surgery thus helps in reducing weight and 
also helps in improving diabetes, lipid profile and Mean 
arterial blood pressure.
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