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The accelerated development of digital and ICT technologies 
is bringing about rapid changes in society. Autonomous 

vehicles, artificial intelligence, and the IoT, which have been 
developing at a rapid pace in recent years, will greatly affect 
future society. We will examine the impact of various digital 
objects on society and examine what problems are facing 
them. The development of artificial intelligence greatly 
improves the intelligence, autonomy, and humanization of 
things. The development of object intelligence also predicts 
the emergence of various autonomous machines. We discuss 
three paradoxes (Moravec's paradox, Polanis' paradox, Lee's 
paradox). Why is artificial intelligence difficult to evolve 

into super artificial intelligence? Autonomous vehicles are 
autonomous machines that are the closest to practical use. 
I present the changes in future society and the ethical and 
philosophical problems that autonomous vehicles will bring. 
With the development of the Internet of Things, we examine 
the possibility of the appearance of Things Sapiens in the future 
and the impact of the Internet of things on future society. 
Technology accelerating phenomena make things more 
difficult to predict in the future. Can we predict the unknown 
things that will emerge in the future? We will discuss how to 
cope with changes in future society, change of future jobs, and 
attitude of future society.
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