
Journal of 
Business and Hotel Management

J Bus Hotel Manage Volume 6 and  Issue:  S(2)

Page 1

Editorial

2021 Conference Announcement International Conference on Business Man-
agement Accounting And Marketing

We are pleased to welcome you to the “International 
Conference on Business Management Accounting and 
Marketing” after the successful completion of the series 
of Business Management Accounting and Marketing 
Congress. This Business Management Accounting and 
Marketing 2021 conference will provide you with an ex-
emplary research experience and huge ideas.

The perspective of the Business Management Accounting 
and Marketing Conference 2021 is to line up new anal-
ysis to assist folks understand however new techniques 
have advanced and the way the sector has developed in 
recent years.

Business Management Accounting and Marketing fore-
sees over two hundred participants from seven continents 
with revolutionary subjects, discussions and expositions. 
this can be a marvellous viability for the researchers, 
students and therefore the delegates from Universities 
and Institutes to amalgamate with the globe category 
Scientists, speakers, technicians and optical maser Practi-
tioners and trade Professionals operating within the field 
of Business Management Accounting, Marketing and its 

related fields.

Business Management Accounting and Marketing is the 
study and application of things that are very little and may 
be used across all the fields of Marketing, like Business 
development, Marketing, business management etc. 

Business Management Accounting and Marketing 2021 
is scheduled with a vision of promoting the field of busi-
ness management, is going to play its own role in the de-
velopment of applicability of business as there will be an 
integration of outstanding and ingenious scientists with 
enthusiastic graduates from all the related fields. Business 
management is the branch of Marketing, Specifically Busi-
ness dealing with the study of Marketing, or life too small 
to be seen with the naked eye. 

People who have lost attending the past conference are 
most welcome to gift your analysis concepts at the. Busi-
ness Management Accounting and Marketing. This con-
ference can assist you improve networking with eminent 
folks within the field of Business Management Account-
ing and Marketing.


